2015 City of Clemson SRF Drinking Water Utility Project

Bid Tab - April 14, 2015

Name Company Bid Amount

Kevin Moorhead Moorhead Construction $2,307,988.75

Jared Weldon J & M Construction $2,349,220.00
Doug Hughes Long & Son Utility No bid
Billy Rice Dillard Excavating No bid
Scott Cline Ruby-Collins, Inc. No bid

Robby McGinn Payne, McGinn & Cummins, Inc. $2,024,395.00
Allan Navida Consolidate Pipe & Supply No bid
John Ballenger Ferguson Waterworks No bid
Eddie Low McWayne Ductile No bid




Payne, Mcginn & Cummins Bid - Revised

SRF Drinking Water - Base Bid

Item No. Item Description Quantity | Unit| Unit Price Total
1 Mobilization 1 LS | $89,606.03 $89,606.03
2 Erosion Control 1 LS | $35,842.41 | $35,842.41
3 6" CL350 DIP Line 20220 LF $48.00 $970,560.00
4 2" PVC Line 2305 LF $31.00 $71,455.00
5 12" Encased Bore 235 LF $140.00 $32,900.00
6 6" Gate Valve 42 EA $930.00 $39,060.00
7 2" Gate Valve 16 EA $500.00 $8,000.00
8 2" Blow-Off 5 EA $800.00 $4,000.00
9 12" Tie-In 2 EA | $4,000.00 $8,000.00
10 10" Tie-In 3 EA | $3,500.00 $10,500.00
11 6" Tie-In 17 EA | $3,500.00 $59,500.00
12 3" Tie-In 1 EA | $3,000.00 $3,000.00
13 2" Tie-In 10 EA | $2,000.00 $20,000.00
14 Fire Hydrant Assembly 25 EA | $3,500.00 $87,500.00
15 3/4" Service (Same Side) 135 EA $500.00 $67,500.00
16 3/4" Service (Opposite Side) 129 EA $700.00 $90,300.00
17 Water Meter Stretch Box 130 EA $300.00 $39,000.00
18 Asphalt Paving 7537 LF $20.00 $150,730.00
19 Concrete Sidewalk (5'X4") 900 LF $30.00 $27,000.00
20 Rock Excavation 50 cY $150.00 $7,500.00

Total Bid:| $1,821,953.44]




